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SUBJECT:   EXPELL ALL MEMBERS OF CONGRESS THAT OPPOSED THE ELECTORAL VOTES THAT DREW THE MOB INTO 

DC BELIEVING MIKE PENCE HAD THE AUTHORITY TO CHANGE THE ELECTORAL VOTE COUNT 
 
Article I, Section V, reads as follows: 

“Each House may determine the Rules of its Proceedings, punish its Members for disorderly Behavior, 
and, with the concurrence of two-thirds, expel a Member” 

The House of Representatives passed Articles of Impeachment on Donald Trump for causing an 
INSURECTION, while the FBI is in the process of identifying and arresting each and everyone that 
stormed the Capitol, which should be charged with TREASON.  However the members of Congress 
that objected to the Electoral vote count have not received any appropriate discipline in their 
involvement in what happened on January 6th, 2021.  Their involvement in objecting to the Electoral 
Vote COUNT was totally UNCONSTITUTIONAL.   The `12th Amendment to the Constitution of the 
United States requires the President of the Senate, the Vice-President in the presenc4e of the House of 
Representatives “shall open all certificates and the votes shall then be counted.”  There is to be no 
debate or objection to the vote count. 

Each and every member knew full well that they could not object to the vote count and also knew that 
the Vice-President had no authority to intervene in any way to change the results of the State Electors, 
chosen by the state.  This CHARADE was staged to draw a MOB to DC and with Donald Trump placing 
enormous pressure on the Vice-Pressure by saying this at his rally on January 6th, 2021:  “And Mike 
Pence, I hope you’re going to stand up for the good of our constitution and for the good of our country. 
And if you’re not, I’m going to be very disappointed in you. “  The Vice-President did stand up for the 
Constitution for the Good of our country.  Members of the MOB would not have had a reason to come 
to DC for a rally, if they read the US Constitution, knew that members of Congress could not object to 
the Electoral vote count and that the Vice-President had no Constitutional Authority to intervene in any 
way to change the outcome of the Presidential Election. 

The Constitution Party of Virginia asks members of the House of Representatives and US Senate vote 
to EXPEL each and every member of their respective chambers that were involved in the attempted 
INSURRECTION in accordance with Article I, Section 5 of the US Constiution?  These members must 
be held accountable for creating a CHARADE that drew this MOB to DC.  No MOB, NO STORMING of 
the Capitol and NO DEATHS.  Please do not let them get away with their ESSENTIAL part in the 
INSURRECTION!   Do not be concerned if the 2/3rd votes to EXPEL them are not there yet, the 
American people will apply pressure to avenge the deaths of five people killed on January 6th, 2021, 
another Day that will live in INFAMY.  Will those that were not involved in the attempted 
INSURRECTION that resulted in the storming of the Capitol leaving five dead have the COURAGE to 
EXPEL those who were?  There are blood on the hands of all involved in this INSURRECTION and 
must be held accountable and punished appropriately. S CENSURE is not appropriate for an event that 
resulted in an assault on the Capitol that led to the death of five people, EXPULSION is, 
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